
PACKAGE COMPANY NAME/ BID

NO. ADDRESS AMOUNT

1 CLERK'S OFFICE -

2 ROCK SOLID CONSTRUCTION

83 CLIFFORD ST NO BID

NEWARK, NJ 07105

3 DS MEYER

63 LONGVIEW DR NO BID

WALDWICK, NJ 07463

4 CONSTRUCTION SOFTWARE

4500 LAKE FOREST DRIVE NO BID

CINC, OH 45242

5 TRINO ASSCIATES $31,875.00

354 VERONA WAY $10,500.00

PARAMUS, NJ 07652

6 JOSEPH SANZARI, INC $67,899.50

90 W FRANKLIN ST $16,848.00

HACKENSACK, NJ 07601

7 4 CLEAN UP $20,850.00

PO BOX 5098 $7,200.00

NORTH BERGEN, NJ 07047

8 JOHN GARCIA CONSTRUCTION $23,675.00

183 FRIAR LANE $6,000.00

CLIFTON, NJ 07013

9 MATINA & SON $31,500.00

146 ENGLISH ST $4,200.00

HACKENSACK, NJ 07601

10 ASCAPE LANDSCAPE & CONSTRUCTION $29,715.00

634 RT 303 $9,120.00

BLAUVELT, NY 10913

11 HASKELL PAVING $40,957.70

30 GREENWOOD LAKE TRPK $15,453.96

RINGWOOD, NJ 07456

WIERIMUS LANE CULVERT GABION WALL IMPROVEMENTS

BOROUGH OF HILLSDALE

BIDS DUE FEBRUARY 5, 2013 AT 11:00 AM

$35.00/SET



13 DR MULLEN CONSTRUCTION $20,681.75

38 EDISON AVE $7,500.00

OAKLAND, NJ 07436

14 COLONELLI BROS INC $19,491.00

409 S RIVER ST $7,800.00

HACKENSACK, NJ 07601

15 COVINO & SONS CONSTRUCTION $19,964.00

39 NORTH DRIVE $7,032.00

ROCHELLE PARK, NJ 07662

17 INGANNAMORTE & SON $28,660.00

211 LAROCHE AVENUE $11,640.00

HARRINGTON PARK, NJ 07640

18 GMP CONTRACTING LLC $20,972.00

3230 HAMILTON BLVD $5,800.00

SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080

19 TILLERMAN

111 KOSCIUZKO RD NO BID

WHITEHOUSE STATION, NJ 08889

20 ADAMO BROS CONSTRUCTION $23,840.00

1033 ALEXCANDER AVE $9,720.00

RIDGEFIELD, NJ 07657-1501


